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Strong server demand to fuel sales & EPS growth           

..     Event 

Wistron is positive on its server sales outlook, which will drive 2025F earnings growth. 

Impact 

1Q25 server sales grew 136% YoY & 42% QoQ. Wistron 1Q25 sales grew 17% QoQ and 
45% YoY, beating consensus and guidance due to stronger-than-expected server sales 
growth for both Wiwynn (6669 TT, NT$1,930, OP) and its own business. Wistron’s server 
sales weighting rose to 62% in 1Q25, while total server sales grew 136% YoY and 42% QoQ. 
Wiwynn’s server sales increased 145% YoY and 48% QoQ, and Wistron’s server sales grew 
107% YoY and 23% QoQ. Wiwynn benefited from general server sales growth and solid 
ASIC AI server sales to Amazon Web Services (US) in 1Q25. Wistron benefited from GB200 
compute board sales expansion and L10 system AI server sales to Dell (US). Given product 
mix improvement, with Wiwynn’s sales weighting rising, we expect 1Q25 gross margin to 
rise QoQ and YoY. Coupled with forex gains, we revise up 1Q25F EPS to NT$1.88, up 1% 
QoQ and 52% YoY. 

2Q25F server demand growth to continue. Given GB200 AI server ramp-up, Wistron’s 
NVL72 system sales to Dell will continue to rise in 2Q25F from a low level in 1Q25. The 
firm expects its server sales growth to be stronger than Wiwynn’s in 2Q25, with UBB sales 
stable QoQ (for HGX), GB200 compute tray sales growth, and robust AI server demand 
from Dell boosted by xAI (US) and Coreweave (US). Dell’s overall order size will be no 
smaller than that from a hyperscaler CSP in 2025F, but higher system level sales will dilute 
Wistron’s gross margin. Despite this, we expect rising server sales to be positive for 
operating profit. With NB demand uncertainty due to US tariff volatility, the firm guides 
2Q25 NB shipment growth of 10% QoQ, and single-digit growth in 2025F on resilient 
commercial NB demand. To reflect a positive sales outlook for servers, we revise up 2025F 
sales growth to 65% YoY, and EPS to NT$8.47, up 39% YoY. On strong server and AI GPU 
demand from clients, the firm recently announced it is expanding capacity in Dallas, Texas, 
US, with Nvidia (US), and we expect production of its GPU baseboards and compute boards 
to start at the new US facility in 2026F. Therefore, its previous NT$35bn 2025F capex plan 
may be increased. On tariff uncertainties, the firm will continue overseas factory 
expansions in Vietnam, Mexico, China, and the US for better production diversification, 
which will strengthen competitiveness and raise entry barriers for competitors. 

Valuation & Action 

On a solid outlook, we maintain Outperform and our target price of NT$135, based on 16x 
2025F EPS. 

Risks 

Weaker-than-expected demand; competition in the AI server market. 
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